
BID OPENING - DONEEN QUARRY, C.R.C.P. No. 175, FEBRUARY 28, 2021 @ 10:45 a.m.

BIDDERS:

ITEM 
NO. DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1 Mobilization 1 L.S. $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 No Bid

2 Furnish & Stockpile 1/2" Maintenance Rock 50,000 Ton $7.00 $350,000.00 $6.25 $312,500.00 No Bid

3 Furnish & Stockpile 3/8" Maintenance Rock 10,000 Ton $7.00 $70,000.00 $6.25 $62,500.00 No Bid

4 Furnish & Stockpile 8" Minus 1,000 Ton $7.00 $7,000.00 $7.50 $7,500.00 No Bid

5 Furnish & Stockpile Crushed Surfacing 
Base Course 2,000 Ton $10.00 $20,000.00 $6.25 $12,500.00 No Bid

6 Furnish & Stockpile 3/8" Chips 2,000 Ton $8.00 $16,000.00 $6.75 $13,500.00 No Bid

7 Wash Stockpiled 3/8" Chips 250 Ton $3.00 $750.00 $5.70 $1,425.00 No Bid

BASIS OF AWARD TOTAL: ITEMS 1-7 $483,750.00 $434,925.00 No Bid

Shawnee Rock, Inc.ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE Seubert Excavators, Inc.


