
BID OPENING - REPP QUARRY, C.R.C.P. No. 169 & UNION CENTER QUARRY, C.R.C.P. No. 170, DECEMBER 16, 2019 @ 11:00 a.m.

BIDDERS: ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE WESTERN CONST. DEATLEY CRUSHING SEUBERT EXCAVATORS

ITEM 
NO. DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED 

QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

REPP QUARRY, C.R.C.P. No. 169

1 Mobilization 1 L.S. $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 NO BID NO BID

2 Furnish & Stockpile Maintenance 28,800 Ton $5.00 $144,000.00 $7.72 $222,336.00 $8.10 $233,280.00 NO BID NO BID

3 Furnish & Stockpile 1/4" Minus 2,000 Ton $8.25 $16,500.00 $7.95 $15,900.00 $15.00 $30,000.00 NO BID NO BID

UNION CENTER QUARRY, C.R.C.P. No. 170

4 Mobilization 1 L.S. $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 NO BID NO BID

5 Furnish & Stockpile Top Course 39,900 Ton $5.00 $199,500.00 $6.75 $269,325.00 $8.75 $349,125.00 NO BID NO BID

6 Furnish & Stockpile 3/8" Chips 6,000 Ton $9.00 $54,000.00 $10.00 $60,000.00 $25.00 $150,000.00 NO BID NO BID

7 Furnish & Stockpile 1/4" Minus 4,000 Ton $8.25 $33,000.00 $9.00 $36,000.00 $15.00 $60,000.00 NO BID NO BID

BASIS OF AWARD TOTAL: ITEMS 1-7 $509,000.00 $673,561.00 $882,405.00 NO BID


